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Parallel Session 1
Chair: Maria Vaalavuo



Alyona Artamonova: Fertility ideals: The role of childhood adversity and support received from
kin and non-kin in young adulthood

Jessica Nisén: Gendered Relationship of Childbearing with Cumulative Earnings in two Nordic
Countries

Michelle Larva: Nature and nurture: pairing developmental and evolutionary approaches in
psychosocial research via Tinbergen’s four questions

Marika Jalovaara: A register-based account of period trends in partnership prevalence, entries,
and exits by educational level for men and women in Finland

Parallel Sessions 
Putous lecture hall

Parallel Session 2
Chair: Tiina Turunen

Inga Saikkonen: Political Gains or Democratic Principles? Issue Polarization and Democratic
Backsliding

Henri Salokangas: The impact of basic income on residential mobility: Evidence from the Finnish
Basic Income Experiment

Mar Espadafor: Addressing the effect of parental education on children’s attainment. New
evidence from a natural experiment using the Spanish 1970 education reform.

Kirsi Peltonen: Cognitive-, Social- and Mental Health- Functions of Refugee Children - Screening
and Supportive Actions at School

Manu 1–2

Parallel Session 3
Chair: Sanna Herkama



Jenni Alisaari: “They don’t need to like me” and “I hate pride!” – Stories behind a "positive" school
climate

Tarja Koffert: Patient-made videos as a tool of self-observation in psychotherapy

Timo Teräsahjo: Development and validation of Parental mentalization questionnaire (PMQ)

Sonja Gilbert: GetStarted – Digital anti-procrastination program for the first-year medical
students

Manu 3–4

12.15–13.45 

Parallel Session 4
Chair: Mikko Niemelä

Keith O'Neill: A new guardian angel for social justice or the original gangster? The role of civil
society in upholding social rights

Kirsi SIppel & Iida Kukkonen: Constructing Chad: How incels build a beauty regime in times of
aesthetic inequality

Waseem Haider: The use of work disability benefits among natives and migrants in Finland: A
full-population register-based study with a 10-year follow-up

Sanju Silwal: Self harm behavior and suicidality of adolescents after the Russian invasion of of
southeastern Ukraine in 2014

Koski



Parallel Session 5
Chair: Christina Salmivalli



Essi-Lotta Tenhunen: Entering the Classroom: Do newcomers report higher peer victimization
than established students? The Finnish compulsory school context

Henrik Dobewall: Phenotype-geneotype differences in social attainment

Tiina Turunen: Disadvantaged or successful? Education and occupation of different subtypes of
adolescent bullies as young adults

Daniela Chávez: A Chance to Be Kinder? Peer Status Profiles and Changes in Prosocial and
Aggressive Behavior in Adolescence

Parallel Sessions 
Putous lecture hall

Parallel Session 6
Chair: Marika Jalovaara

Vera de Bel: Parental investment and adult children’s entry into parenthood: The difference
between intended and actual age of first birth

Lydia Veronica Palumbo: A Better Parent? Family-Dynamic Social Mobility and Socioeconomic
Inheritance

Linus Andersson: Partnership contexts of births and cohort fertility rates

Merita Mesiäislehto: Does early childhood education promote parental wellbeing? 

Manu 1–2

Parallel Session 7
Chair: Elina Kilpi-Jakonen



Mari Haapanen: Children’s living arrangements and mothers’ economic well-being post-
separation in Finland and the United States

Laura Heiskala: Parental workplace educational composition and children’s higher education
enrolment

Lucia Ruggera: How the expansion of Finnish educational system has shaped the
intergenerational process: a counterfactual approach

Jani Erola, Outi Sirniö, Hannu Lehti, Michael Grätz, Kieron Barclay: The pattern of educational
inequality – The contribution of family background on levels of education over time and across
four countries – methodological considerations

Manu 3–4

14.15–15.45 

Parallel Session 8
Chair: Erika Lilja

Kaisa Mishina: Changes in mental health symptoms among children and adolescents before and
during the COVID-19 pandemic

David Gyllenberg: Comparison of new psychiatric diagnoses among Finnish children and
adolescents before and during the COVID-19 pandemic

Sakari Lintula: Associations between COVID-19 restrictions in Finland and internet-assisted
guided parental intervention implementation enrolment and dropout rates.

Koski


